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Note: None of the cells are protected; Bid Tab works best if you use the un-shaded spaces, then clear away all shading before printing.  See further instructions in the Designers' Manual Chapter 5 on Procurement

Page of Pursuant to the Invitation to Bid extended for Signature required only by Presiding Official.
Others can be printed or typed.

Bids opened in How many Presiding 

Admin Bldg Rm 202 Addenda issued: Official

Target Contract Time bids and modifications must have been received here by Designer 

4,700,000                     days represented by

MACC Liquidated Damages I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed to open Owner 

5,185,000                     per day and read bids and modifications which have been received. represented by

Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, license number) Crime 
Stm

Adden 
Ack

Bid 
Secur

Unit 
Prices

Drug 
Affid Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Alt #4 Other notations

Electrical White Electircal Construction Co Name
Geotherm None Required

HVAC Jake Marshall Service, Inc

Masonry BCR to Self Perform City Sent acknowledged Crime statement within a few hours of bid opening
Plumbing None Required License Number Base+Alt.1= Base+A1,2= Base+A1,2,3=  
Roofing Tri-State Roofing Contractors 4,411,830.00 4,507,374.00 4,803,587.00  
Electrical Name
Geotherm

HVAC

Masonry City

Plumbing License Number     
Roofing     
Electrical Name
Geotherm

HVAC

Masonry City

Plumbing License Number     
Roofing     
Electrical Name
Geotherm

HVAC

Masonry City

Plumbing License Number     
Roofing     
Electrical White Electircal Name
Geotherm None Required

HVAC Jake Marshall Service

Masonry Midwest Maintenance Inc City

Plumbing None Required License Number Base+Alt.1= Base+A1,2= Base+A1,2,3=  
Roofing Tri-State Roofing Co 4,842,861.00 4,954,337.00 5,250,615.00  
Electrical Massey Construction Inc. dba 

Massey Electric Co. Name
Geotherm None Required
HVAC Jake Marshall Service

Masonry Jenkins Masonry, Inc. City

Plumbing None Required License Number Base+Alt.1= Base+A1,2= Base+A1,2,3=  
Roofing Tri-State Roofing Contractors 4,850,207.00 5,186,457.00 5,895,877.00  







N/A

UNIT PRICES:                                
1. $7.00/SF                                     
2. $123.00/SF                                
3. $48.50/SF                                  
4. $13.00/SF                                  
5. $46.50/LF                                   
6. $14.50/LF

NOT PRESENT/ NO BID

NOT PRESENT/ NO BID

296,278.00

NOT PRESENT/ NO BID
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2 Building Envelope Repairs - Subproject 2

296,213.00 N/A

UNIT PRICES:                                 
1. $4.50/SF                                   
2. $100.00/SF                                
3. $35.00/SF                                  
4. $18.00/SF                                 
5. $500.00/LF                                
6. $220.00/LF

Waterford, Ohio

76380

   95,544.00
Buckeye Construction & 
Restoration, Ltd.

Matthew ParksSBC# 540/005-03-2023

Tilman"Trey" Wheeler365 UTC - Room 202 Administrative Services Building until 3:00pm, local time on Nov 18 ,2025

Tilman"Trey" Wheeler$1,000

49,788.00 4,362,042.00

Farmer│Morgan

Eaton Construction

40,707.00

Ketom Construction 
Company,Inc.

Base bid 
of 
5,203,000
.00          
Add to 
Base bid= 
6500.00    
Deduct of 

336,250.00 709,420.00 N/A

UNIT PRICES:                                 
1. $3.85/SF                                     
2. $71.50/SF                                  
3. $39.60/SF                                  
4. $16.50/SF                                  
5. $300.30/LF                                 
6. $22.00/LF

Chattanooga TN

37029

Midwest Maintenance, 
Inc.     4,798,422.00 44,439.00 111,476.00
Piqua, Ohio 

62079

P&C Construction, Inc
    4,809,500.00
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Bids opened in How many Presiding 

Admin Bldg Rm 202 Addenda issued: Official

Target Contract Time bids and modifications must have been received here by Designer 

4,700,000                                    days represented by

MACC Liquidated Damages I, thus declare the bidding closed, and now will proceed to open Owner 

5,185,000                                    per day and read bids and modifications which have been received. represented by

Regulated Subcontractors Bidders (name, city, license number) Crime 
Stm

Adden 
Ack

Bid 
Secur

Unit 
Prices

Drug 
Affid Base Bid Alt #1 Alt #2 Alt #3 Alt #4 Other notations

Electrical Name
Geotherm

HVAC

Masonry City

Plumbing License Number     
Roofing     
Electrical Massey Electric Company Name
Geotherm N/A Base Bid amt = 4,411,000.00    
HVAC Jake Marshall Service, Inc Base bid deduct = 88,707.00              
Masonry United Restoration & Preservation Inc. City Base bid total =4,322,293.00         
Plumbing N/A License Number Base+Alt.1= Base+A1,2= Base+A1,2,3=  Alt #1=56,869.00                         Alt#1 deduct=15,443.00               Alt #1total =41,426.00                  Alt                                     
Roofing Tri-State Roofing Contractors, LLC 4,363,719.00 4,551,743.00 5,298,195.00  Alt #2 add=3,547.00                    Alt #2 total =41,426.00                      
Electrical Name Alt #3=751,426.00                         
Geotherm Alt #3 deduct=4,974                    Alt #3total =746,452.00
HVAC

Masonry City

Plumbing License Number     
Roofing     
Electrical Name
Geotherm

HVAC

Masonry City

Plumbing License Number     
Roofing     

UNIT PRICES:                                 
1. $7.00/SF                                     
2. $260.00/SF                                  
3. $31.00/SF                                  
4. $13.00/SF                                  
5. $938.00/LF                                 
6. $14.00/LF

Chattanooga, TN

80602

United Restoration 
Preservation

 4,322,293.00 41,426.00Shelby Company, LLC
    188,024.00 746,452.00 N/A

NOT PRESENT/ NO BID

NOT PRESENT/ NO BID

Pillar Construction

Tilman"Trey" Wheeler$1,000

F54   Bid Tab 2 2 University of Tennessee, Chattanooga

1 Building Envelope Repairs - Subproject 2 Matthew ParksSBC# 540/005-03-2023

Tilman"Trey" Wheeler365 UTC - Room 202 Administrative Services Building until 3:00pm, local time on Nov 18 ,2025
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